Thompson &

Briggs Prime Consulting | S. W. Engineering Lichtner Co. Sage Environmental
Ttem # Description Price Price Price Price Price
1. Soils & Earthwork
1 Field Geotechnical Engineer $95.00/hour $60.00/hour $130.00/hour $80.00/hour See Attached
2| Soil Compaction & Moisture Content Testing $62.00/Hour $50.00/hour $90.00/hour $70.00/hour See Attached
3| Electronic Nuclear Moisture-Density Gauge $68.00/Day $50.00/day $50.00/day $55.00/day See Attached
4 Modified Protector $125.00/each $100.00/each $130.00/each $120.00/each See Attached
5 Washed Sieve Analysis $115.00/each $100.00/each $110.00/each $75.00/each See Attached
6 Loam Analysis $350.00/each $50.00/each $190.00/each $75.00/each See Attached
1L Cast In-Place Concrete
1 Certified Concrete Batch Plant Inspector $65.00/hour $50.00/hour $100.00/hour $75.00/hour See Attached
o |ACHCertified Conerete Field Tecmlag’;%’ $68.00/Hour $50.00/hour $90.00/hour $58.00/hour See Attached
3 Concrete Test Cylinders 4" x 8" $25.00/each $25.00/each $20.00/each $20.00/each See Attached
4 Mix Design Review $95.00/each $50.00/each $67.50/each $100.00/each See Attached
5 Vapor Emissions & pH Testing of Concrete|$78.00/hour $35.00/test $50.00/hour $100.00/hour $70.00/hour See Attached
Floors kit $50.00/test kit $50.00/test kit $40.00/test kit
6 Determination of Relative Humidity in $78.00/hour $100.00/hour $100.00/hour $70.00/hour See Attached
Concrete Floors $35.00/probe $100.00/probe $50.00/probe $70.00/probe
7 Floor Flatness-Levelness Inspection $ZS;T(§(())(‘)(3(S);daS¥ab $500.00/day $300.00/day $1400.00/day See Attached
1L Masonry
1 Field Masonry Inspector $70.00/hour $50.00/hour $100.00/hour $60.00/hour See Attached
o|  TBC Certified Structural Masonry Speciall - g7¢ 1,0 $50.00/hour $100.00/hour $75.00/hour See Attached
Inspector
3 Laboratory Services
a| Test Concrete Masonry Unit (ASTM C-140) $175.00/set $120.00/set $240.00/set $150.00/set See Attached
b Grout Prisms or Cylinders (ASTM C1314) $35.00/each $25.00/each $50.00/each $20.00/each See Attached
c| Strength Test CMU Prisms (ASTM C1314) $65.00/each $25.00/each $145.00/each $65.00/each See Attached
d| Mortar on Non-Shrink Grout Cubes (ACS%/; $35.00/cach $25.00/cach $30.00/cach $20.00/cach See Attached
Structural & Reinforcing Steel, Joists, Deck,
v, studs, Light Gauge Metal Framing (LGMF),
Misc. Metal, and Non-Destructive
Examination (NDE)
1 Formwork & Reinforcing Steel Inspection $78.00/hour $50.00/hour $100.00/hour $70.00/hour See Attached
2 Visual Steel Erection Inspection $85.00/hour $75.00/hour $125.00/hour $80.00/hour See Attached
3 AWS Certified Welding Inspector $95.00/hour $75.00/hour $125.00/hour $87.50/hour See Attached
$125.00/hour
4 Non-Destructive Examination $90.00/hour $90.00/hour (1nclu§§:rzce112§ment $150.00/hour See Attached
$250.00/day)
V. Spray Fireproofing
1 ICC Certified Fireproofing Isnpector $70.00/hour $75.00/hour $100.00/hour $75.00/hour See Attached
a. Adhesion Test $25.00/each $45.00/each $35.00/each $30.00/each See Attached
b. Density Test $25.00/each $45.00/each $35.00/each $70.00/each See Attached
VL Firestopping
$75.00/hour
1 ICC Certified Fireproofing Isnpector $70.00/hour $75.00/hour $100.00/hour ?Experlenced See Attached
nspector, not
ICC certified)
Certification of method and type of
a. application for opening and rating required $70.00/each $45.00/each No Bid $150.00/each See Attached

and in compliance with FM/UL criteria
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Building Envelope (Roofing, Air/Vapor
ViI Barrier, Siding, Waterproofing, Windows,
Store Front & Curtain Walls
1 Visual Inspection of Building Evenlope| g7¢ $75.00/hour No Bid $140.00/hour See Attached
Components
2 Applicable Field Testing
a Air & Water Infiltration Test $2,150.00/day $4500.00/day No Bid $3,100.00/day See Attached
b Water Leakage Check (AAMA 501.2)|  $165.00/hour $70.00/hour No Bid $775.00mour (for| g \iached
two people)
c Air Leak Testing (ASTM E1186 4.2.6) $2,150.00/day $70.00/day No Bid $3,360.00/day See Attached
d Air Leak Testing (ASTM E1186 42.7)|  $165.00/hour $70.00/hour No Bid $46%%2ﬁ‘;1f) (forl  gee Attached
| Air'Vapor Barrier Adhesion Pull Test g\g‘% $85.00/hour $70.00/hour No Bid $80.00/hour See Attached
$95.00/hour
f] Joint Sealant Adhesion Pull Test (Eq}upmént, Sealant, $70.00/hour No Bid $140.00/hour See Attached
Dollies billed at cost +
15%)
g Infrared Thermal Scan $1,850.00/day $3,500.00/day No Bid $3,270.00/day See Attached
h Fastener Pull-Out Test $95.00/hour $120.00/hour No Bid $120.00/hour See Attached
i Heat Welded Seam Testing $125.00/hour $80.00/hour No Bid No Bid See Attached
j Roof Drain Testing $165.00/hour $90.00/hour No Bid $140.00/hour See Attached
VIII Bituminous Asphalt See Attached
1 NETTCP Certified Bituminous Field| g 030 $50.00/hour $100.00/hour $75.00/hour See Attached
Technician
2 Thickness Evaluation and/or Coring of]|
Pavement Mixture Field
*There is no charge
per test if these tests
are performed at the
3 Laboratory Tests asphalt suppliers
laboratory. Only the
hourly charge will
apply.
| Preparation of Marshall Specimens (AASTI;I;; $150.00/cach set | $200.00/cach set $1°°'00$f“r/ cach | 100.00/cach set|  See Attached
p| Bulk Specific Gravity of Mixtures (AASTIES $75.00/each $50.00/each $40.00/cach $55.00/each See Attached
Theorectical Maximum Specific Gravity
c (AASHTO T209) $85.00/each $50.00/each $120.00/each $75.00/each See Attached
Extraction of Bitumen from Mix & Gradation
d (AASHTO T164) $350.00/each $50.00/each $200.00/each $125.00/each See Attached
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X Miscellaneous
j| QA/QC Consultant Services or Res‘;a;:geg $125.00/hour $75.00/hour $135.00mour | $160.00/hour See Attached
5|  Reistered Professional Engineer/Special| ¢35 5 . $160.00/hour $250.00/hour $175.00/hour See Attached
Inspection Coordinator (if needed)
Will charge for the
rate quoted for
service requested.
Technicians are cross
trained for Concrete,
Soils, Masonry, and
3 Cross Trained QA/QC Inspector (full time) $78.00/hour $50.00/hour Bituminous Asphalt. $110.00/hour See Attached
Wood Framing and
Structural Steel
doesn't have that
option due to the
complexity and
experience needed
for those inspections.
$25.00/round trip (from
4| Mileage Expense to/from site per round trip| RI Facility) $70.00/trip | $80.00/round trip $3.00/round trip  [$75.00/round trip See Attached
(MA Facility)
1 hour round trip (RI 175 hours round
5 Round Trip Travel Time per Site Visit| facility) 2.5 hours 1 hour round trip | .25 hours/round trip | i See Attached
round trip (MA Facility P
g| ~ Transportation of Samples from the Site to No Charge $80.00/trip $25.50/trip $160.00/trip See Attached
Laboratory
7 Normal Turnaround Time for Lab Results is X
Working Days from Date Received
Regular Rate x 3
(24 hour No additional
Requested "Rush" Laboratory Results will be turnaround time) | charges for 24 hour No additional fee See Attached
charged at: Regular Rate x 2 turn around on
(24 - 48 hour common tests
turnaround time)
8 Overtime Rate (over 8 hours on site)
Second Shift Rates Base rate x 1.5 Base rate x 1.5 Base rate x 1.15 Base rate x 1.5 See Attached
Third Shift Rates Base rate x 1.5 Base rate x 1.5 Base rate x 1.15 Base rate x 1.5 See Attached
Saturday Rates Base rate x 1.5 Base rate x 1.5 Base rate x 1.15 Base rate x 1.5 See Attached
Sunday/Hoilday Rates Base rate x 2 Base rate x 2 Base rate x 1.15 Base rate x 1.5 See Attached




