
Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Bid Price Unit Price Total Bid Price Unit Price Total Bid Price Unit Price Total Bid Price

1
Glock 45 MOS w/ AmeriGlo XL Height Sights 

(Black outline Tritium Front/Black rear GL-809), 
Holoson 509t Rf direct mount installed

10 852.67$              8,526.70$           857.67$                8,576.70$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
Glock Model 43X MOS w/ Aimpoint COA Optic 

direct mount installed
5 664.60$              3,323.00$           664.60$                3,323.00$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Safariland 7360RDS-28327 – Level III Retention 
Duty Holster (Plain Finish) RIGHT-HANDED

15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Safariland 7360RDS-28327 – Level III Retention 

Duty Holster (Plain Finish) LEFT-HANDED
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
Safariland Solis ALS Concealment OWB Holster 

(Part SOLIS-1-895-2-7-C1-411) RIGHT-
HANDED

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Streamlight TLR-7X 500 lumens 10 135.75$              1,357.50$           139.00$                1,390.00$           131.11$                1,311.11$                131.12$              1,311.20$          

7 Streamlight TLR-7/X/HL-XSub 5 135.75$              678.75$              179.00$                895.00$              134.18$                670.90$                   152.48$              762.40$             

8 15 Round Magazines for Glock Model 43X 10 19.99$                199.90$              21.00$                  210.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Total Bid Amount (Items 1-8) 14,085.85$         14,394.70$         1,982.01$                2,073.60$          

Vendor

G T Distributors, Inc. 

1124 New Meister Lane, Suite 100

Pflugerville, TX 78660

Vendor

601 US RT 2

Waterbury, VT 05676

Vendor

Parro's Gun Shop & Police Supplies Dana Safety Supply, Inc

45 Oak Street

City of East Providence

Police Department

RFP EP25/26-06R Police Duty Gear Re-Bid

Bid Opening: Tuesday, April 21, 2026, at 11:00am

Bid Tabulations

Westborough, MA 01581Rochester, NY 14624

100 Airpark Drive

Vendor

AmChar Wholesale Inc. 


