City of East Providence Controllers Employee: lJessica Lamprey

Police Department Controllers Employee: Beth Faustino

RFP EP25/26-06 Police Duty Gear Police Employee: Michael Pendergast

Bid Opening Wednesday, March 25, 2026, at 11:00am

Bid Tabulations
Vendor Vendor
Atlantic Tactical, Inc. Anarexus LLC
3319 Anvil Place 365 Hemingway Avenue, Suite 203
Raleigh, NC 27603 East Haven, CT 06512
Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Bid Price Unit Price Total Bid Price
Glock 45 MOS w/ Ameriglo Black Front Night
1 Sight, Non-Night Sight Rear, with Holosun 509T 10 NO BID NO BID $ 650.00 | $ 6,500.00
Rd Direct mount installed
2 Glock Model 43X MOS w/ Aimpoint COA Optic 5 NO BID NO BID $ 1,250.00 | $ 6,250.00

Safariland 7360RDS-28327 — Level III Retention
3 Duty Holster (Plain Finish) RIGHT-HANDED 15 $ 160.73 | $ 2:41095 | $ 295.00 1 $ 4,425.00

Safariland 7360RDS-28327 — Level 111 Retention
4 Duty Holster (Plain Finish) LEFT-HANDED > $ 160.73 | $ 803.65 | $ 295.00 | $ 1,475.00

Safariland Solis ALS Concealment OWB Holster

5 (Part SOLIS-1-895-2-7-C1-411) RIGHT- 5 $ 59.80 | $ 299.00 | § 120.00 | $ 600.00
HANDED

6 Streamlight TLR-7X 500 lumens 10 $ 14133 | § 1,413.30 | § 140.00 | $ 1,400.00

7 Streamlight TLR-7/X/HL-XSub 5 $ 16437 | § 821.85( $ 165.00 | § 825.00

Total Bid Amount (Items 1-7) $ 5,748.75

©«

21,475.00 |




