

**ROBERTO L. DASILVA
MAYOR**



**JESSICA LAMPREY
PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST**

**CITY OF EAST PROVIDENCE
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
145 TAUNTON AVENUE
EAST PROVIDENCE, RI 02914**

Bid Tabulations Thursday, May 1, 2025, 11:00am

RFP EP24/25-012 Police Department Fitness Equipment

Location: Conference Room 306, East Providence City Hall

Present: Jessica Lamprey, Procurement Specialist
Sgt. Michael O'Connell, Police Department

Representatives: None

Bids Received: 8

Alpha Omega Fitness Equipment	26 Indian Falls Rd.	New Boston, NH 03070
BSN Sports LLC.	14460 Varsity Brands Way	Farmers Branch, TX 75244
Combat Brands, LLC	15850 W 108 th St.	Lenexa, KS 66219
CSM Fitness USA LLC	2020 Fall River Ave.	Seekonk, MA 02771
Fitness Superstore	537 Stone Rd. Suite F	Benecia, CA 94510
Fitnessmith	1 Main St. Building 9	Whitinsville, MA 01588
Fittrax Fitness Systems LLC	67 Victoria Farm Rf.	Freemont, NH 03044
WynnPro LLC	5310 Ashbrook Dt.	Houston, TX 77081

CONTINUED NEXT PAGE

**EP24/25-012 Police Department Fitness Equipment
Bid Opening: Thursday, May 1, 2025 at 11:00am**

Bid Items as Specified

Item Number	Description	Quantity	CSM Fitness USA LLC			Fitnessmith			Alpha Omega Fitness Equipment		
			Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price
1	BATCA Axis Free Trainer/functional Trainer 200Lbs. Weight Stacks	1	1-3 year	\$ 5,130.00	\$ 5,130.00	See Attached	\$ 3,275.00	\$ 3,275.00	10 Year Frame, 5 Year Parts	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,999.00
2	BATCA Axis Free-Weight Rack	1	1-3 year	\$ 2,530.00	\$ 2,530.00	See Attached	\$ 2,105.00	\$ 2,105.00	10 Year Frame, 5 Year Parts	\$ 2,599.00	\$ 2,999.00
3	BATCA Axis Smith Trainer with Storage	1	1-3 year	\$ 3,830.00	\$ 3,830.00	See Attached	\$ 3,055.00	\$ 3,055.00	10 Year Frame, 5 Year Parts	\$ 2,599.00	\$ 2,999.00
4	Spirit Fitness Adjustable Ab Bench, Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	1	5-10 year	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	See Attached	\$ 1,185.00	\$ 1,185.00	10 Year Frame, 5 Year Parts	\$ 949.00	\$ 1,175.00
5	Spirit Fitness Adjustable Bench Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	3	5-10 year	\$ 749.00	\$ 2,247.00	See Attached	\$ 960.00	\$ 2,880.00	-	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,095.00
6	Spirit CT800 Treadmill Standard Console: US Commercial	1	5-10 year	\$ 3,930.00	\$ 3,930.00	See Attached	\$ 2,795.00	\$ 2,795.00	-	\$ 3,999.00	\$ 4,199.00
7	Spirit AB950 Airbike: US Commercial	1	5-10 year	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 1,530.00	See Attached	\$ 1,435.00	\$ 1,435.00	-	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 1,899.00
8	Spirit Fitness Vertical Leg Raise/Dip Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	1	5-10 year	\$ 1,230.00	\$ 1,230.00	See Attached	\$ 1,265.00	\$ 1,265.00	-	\$ 999.00	\$ 1,199.00
9	Nautilus Triple Dumbbell Rack	1	5-10 year	\$ 1,885.00	\$ 1,885.00	See Attached	\$ 825.00	\$ 825.00	-	\$ 1,199.00	\$ 1,500.00
10	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 45lbs	10	3 year	\$ 102.00	\$ 1,020.00	See Attached	\$ 149.00	\$ 1,490.00	-	\$ 998.00	\$ 1,100.00
11	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 35lbs	6	3 year	\$ 79.00	\$ 474.00	See Attached	\$ 120.00	\$ 720.00	-	\$ 499.00	\$ 595.00
12	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 25lbs	6	3 year	\$ 57.00	\$ 342.00	See Attached	\$ 88.00	\$ 528.00	-	\$ 399.00	\$ 455.00
13	Power Stream Olympic Urethane Plate 10lbs	12	3 year	\$ 22.50	\$ 270.00	See Attached	\$ 21.00	\$ 252.00	-	\$ 325.00	\$ 360.00
14	Power Stream Olympic Urethane Plate 5lbs	10	3 year	\$ 12.00	\$ 120.00	See Attached	\$ 10.50	\$ 105.00	-	\$ 120.00	\$ 155.00
15	DXP Kettle Bell Rack	1	3 year	\$ 464.00	\$ 464.00	See Attached	\$ 340.00	\$ 340.00	-	\$ 550.00	\$ 600.00
16	Kettle Bell Set 5-50lbs	1	3 year	\$ 730.00	\$ 730.00	See Attached	\$ 428.25	\$ 428.25	-	\$ 550.00	\$ 625.00
17	Kettle Bell 24KG (53lbs)	1	3 year	\$ 241.00	\$ 241.00	See Attached	\$ 86.00	\$ 86.00	-	\$ 100.00	\$ 110.00
18	Kettle Bell 28KG (62lbs)	1	3 year	\$ 259.00	\$ 259.00	See Attached	\$ 93.00	\$ 93.00	-	\$ 125.00	\$ 135.00
19	Kettle Bell 32KG (70lbs)	1	3 year	\$ 275.00	\$ 275.00	See Attached	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00	-	\$ 140.00	\$ 149.00
20	Walk-in 56-inch Olympic bar, heavy duty	1	3 year	\$ 384.00	\$ 384.00	See Attached	\$ 255.00	\$ 255.00	-	\$ 195.00	\$ 225.00
21	4ft Black Curl Bar (high-end), no collar	1	3 year	\$ 250.00	\$ 250.00	See Attached	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	-	\$ 120.00	\$ 155.00
22	Oly 86 1,000lb Hard Chromed bar, with 2 needle bearing, 28mm	1	3 year	\$ 384.00	\$ 384.00	See Attached	\$ 233.00	\$ 233.00	-	\$ 299.00	\$ 350.00
23	47" Olympic Super Curl Bar with collars	1	3 year	\$ 233.00	\$ 233.00	See Attached	\$ 32.00	\$ 32.00	-	\$ 125.00	\$ 145.00
24	TKO Bar Holder	1	3 year	\$ 384.00	\$ 384.00	See Attached	\$ 210.00	\$ 210.00	-	\$ 125.00	\$ 150.00
25	TKO Vertical Dumbbell Rack	1	3 year	\$ 250.00	\$ 250.00	See Attached	\$ 167.00	\$ 167.00	-	\$ 250.00	\$ 300.00
26	PowerStream 5lbs-100lbs Urethane Pro Style Dumbbells	1	3 year	\$ 3,933.00	\$ 3,933.00	See Attached	\$ 5,390.00	\$ 5,390.00	-	\$ 3,799.00	\$ 3,999.00
27	TKO 3'x6' gym Folding Exercise Mat	1	3 year	\$ -	\$ -	See Attached	\$ 199.00	\$ 199.00	-	\$ 30.00	\$ 40.00
28	TRX Straps	2	3 year	\$ -	\$ -	See Attached	\$ 199.00	\$ 398.00	-	\$ 500.00	\$ 600.00
29	DXP Black Trap Bar	1	3 year	\$ -	\$ -	See Attached	\$ 169.00	\$ 169.00	-	\$ 125.00	\$ 135.00
30	Functional Accessory Kit including rope, D Handles, 40" bar and ankle straps	1	3 year	\$ -	\$ -	See Attached	Included in BATCA Axis Free Trainer		-	\$ 55.00	\$ 65.00
					\$ 33,590.00			\$ 30,120.25			\$ 31,512.00

EP24/25-012 Police Department Fitness Equipment
 Bid Opening: Thursday, May 1, 2025 at 11:00am

Bid Alternate Items/Manufacturers

Item Number	Description	Quantity	Combat Sports				Fitness Superstore			
			Substitution/Alternative Mfg.	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price	Substitution/Alternative Mfg.	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price
1	BATCA Axis Free Trainer/functional Trainer 200lbs. Weight Stacks	1	TKO 950 Ft Dual Adjustable Pulley Functional Trainer	Frame: 10 Years Parts: 5 years Cables: 1 Year Upholstery/grips/roller: 6 months	\$ 2,865.00	\$ 2,865.00	French Fitness FFB Black Dual Adjustable Pulley (New)	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 3,166.24	\$ 3,166.24
2	BATCA Axis Free-Weight Rack	1	Fitness First Half Rack	10 Year Structure Frame of Equipment. 3 Year parts within frame	\$ 896.00	\$ 896.00	French Fitness SHR80 Single Half Rack/Cage (New)	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 1,898.95	\$ 1,898.95
3	BATCA Axis Smith Trainer with Storage	1	TKO 8725-BK Plate Loaded Smith Machine	Frame: 10 Years Parts: 5 years Cables: 1 Year Upholstery/grips/roller: 6 months	\$ 2,242.00	\$ 2,242.00	French Fitness Marin Smith Machine Plate Loaded (New)	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 2,990.24	\$ 2,990.24
4	Spirit Fitness Adjustable Ab Bench, Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	1	Core Fitness (Nautilus) Adjustable Abdominal Bench 9NP-B7510 (will be customized as requested)	Limited 10-year warranty on structural frame not including coatings, 5 years parts on major mechanical components - guide rods, plates, bearings, etc. 1 year on minor mechanical components - plate switches, cables, grips, etc. 90 days on upholstery, 1 year labor.	\$ 954.50	\$ 954.50	French Fitness FFS Silver Abdominal/Adj Decline Bench	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 1,362.24	\$ 1,362.24
5	Spirit Fitness Adjustable Bench Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	3	Core Fitness (Nautilus) Multi-Adjustable Bench 9NP-B7506 (will be customized as requested)	Limited 10-year warranty on structural frame, not including coatings, 5 years parts on major mechanical components - guide rods, plates, bearings, etc. 1 year on minor mechanical components - plate switches, cables, grips, etc. 90 days on upholstery, 1 year labor	\$ 1,109.50	\$ 3,328.50	French Fitness MAB30 Multi Adjustable Bench	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 1,415.04	\$ 4,245.12
6	Spirit CT800 Treadmill Standard Console: US Commercial	1	Star Trac S Series S-TRC Treadmill	Limited 10-year warranty on structural frame, not including coatings, motor, and MCB. 5-year parts, labor. All other components warranted for 2 years parts and 1 year labor	\$ 3,965.00	\$ 3,965.00	French Fitness T800 Commercial Treadmill	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 3,210.24	\$ 3,210.24
7	Spirit AB950 Airbike: US Commercial	1	TKO Airaid Bike 8AB	Frame: 5 Years Parts: 2 Years	\$ 871.00	\$ 871.00	French Fitness FF-AFB Air Fan Bike	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 1,124.64	\$ 1,124.64
8	Spirit Fitness Vertical Leg Raise/Dip Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	1	CORE Fitness (Nautilus) Pull-up/Dip/Leg-Raise Model 9NP-B7511 (will be customized as requested)	Limited 10 Year warranty on structural frame, not including coatings, 5 years parts on major mechanical components - guide rods, plates, bearings, etc. 1 year on minor mechanical components - plate switches, cables, grips, etc. 90 days on upholstery, 1 year labor	\$ 1,354.00	\$ 1,354.00	French Fitness Black FFB Pull Up/Vertical Knee Raise VKR	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 1,934.24	\$ 1,934.24
9	Nautilus Triple Dumbbell Rack	1	Bid as Requested	Limited 10-year warranty on structural frame, not including coatings, 5 years parts on major mechanical components - guide rods, plates, bearings, etc. 1 year on minor mechanical components - plate switches, cables, grips, etc. 90 days on upholstery, 1 ye	\$ 1,358.00	\$ 1,358.00	French Fitness 3 Tier Saddle 15 Pair Dumbbell Rack	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 1,133.44	\$ 1,133.44
10	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 45lbs	10	TKO 802PB2 Bumper Plate w/ White Lettering	Two Years	\$ 65.00	\$ 650.00	French Fitness Olympic Colored Bumper Plate 45 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 78.32	\$ 783.20
11	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 35lbs	6	TKO 802PB2 Bumper Plate w/ White Lettering	Two Years	\$ 51.00	\$ 306.00	French Fitness Olympic Colored Bumper Plate 35 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 60.72	\$ 364.32
12	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 25lbs	6	TKO 802PB3 Bumper Plate w/ White Lettering	Two Years	\$ 38.00	\$ 228.00	French Fitness Olympic Colored Bumper Plate 25 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 47.52	\$ 285.12
13	Power Stream Olympic Urethane Plate 10lbs	12	Fitness First Urethane Grip Weight Plates	Five Years	\$ 20.00	\$ 240.00	French Fitness Olympic Colored Bumper Plate 10 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 51.92	\$ 623.04
14	Power Stream Olympic Urethane Plate 5lbs	10	Fitness First Urethane Grip Weight Plates	Five Years	\$ 9.72	\$ 97.20	French Fitness Olympic Colored Bumper Plate 5 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 29.92	\$ 299.20
15	DXP Kettle Bell Rack	1	Fitness First Kettlebell Rack	10 Year Structure Frame of Equipment. 3 Year parts within frame	\$ 226.00	\$ 226.00	French Fitness 3 Tier Kettlebell Rack	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 601.04	\$ 601.04
16	Kettle Bell Set 5-50lbs	1	TKO 857KBV-A10 5-50 lb Kettlebell Set Vinyl Dipped	1 Year	\$ 405.00	\$ 405.00	French Fitness Cast Iron Kettlebell Set 5-50 lbs	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 601.04	\$ 605.00

Bid Alternate Items/Manufacturers

Item Number	Description	Quantity	Combat Sports				Fitness Superstore			
			Substitution/Alternative Mfg.	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price	Substitution/Alternative Mfg.	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price
17	Kettle Bell 24KG (53lbs)	1	Fitness First Iron Kettlebells	1 Year	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	French Fitness Cast Iron Kettlebell 55 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 87.12	\$ 87.12
18	Kettle Bell 28KG (62lbs)	1	Fitness First Iron Kettlebells	1 Year	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	French Fitness Cast Iron Kettlebell 60 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 95.92	\$ 95.92
19	Kettle Bell 32KG (70lbs)	1	Fitness First Iron Kettlebells	1 Year	\$ 57.00	\$ 57.00	French Fitness Cast Iron Kettlebell 70 lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 109.12	\$ 109.12
20	Walk-in 56-inch Olympic bar, heavy duty	1	Solid Bar Fitness Open-end-hex-shrug-bar	Lifetime Warranty against mfg. defects on all of their bars	\$ 212.00	\$ 212.00	French Fitness Open Hex Olympic Trap Shrug Bar	1 Year Limited	\$ 192.72	\$ 192.72
21	4ft Black Curl Bar (high-end), no collar	1	Solid Bar Fitness Heavy Duty Curl Bar	Lifetime Warranty against mfg. defects on all of their bars	\$ 183.00	\$ 183.00	French Fitness Black 47" Olympic EZ Curl Bar	1 Year Limited	\$ 78.32	\$ 78.32
22	Oly 86 1,000lb Hard Chromed bar, with 2 needle bearing, 28mm	1	TRX 8120B-86 Olympic Power Bar	5-year limited warranty	\$ 148.00	\$ 148.00	French Fitness 7' 45 lb Olympic Power Bar -1500 lb	1 Year Limited	\$ 223.52	\$ 223.52
23	47" Olympic Super Curl Bar with collars	1	TRX 8130B-47 Olympic Curl Bar Fitness First Collars	5-year limited warranty	\$ 86.99	\$ 86.99	French Fitness Chrome 47" Olympic EZ Curl Bar. French Fitness Black ABS Olympic Jaw Lock Collars/Clamps (Pair)	1 Year Limited	\$78.32 Bar \$21.12 Clamps	\$78.32 Bar \$21.12 Clamps
24	TKO Bar Holder	1	Bid as Requested	Frame: 10 Years Parts: 1 Year	\$ 136.00	\$ 136.00	French Fitness Vertical Olympic 9 Bar Rack Holder	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 82.72	\$ 82.72
25	TKO Vertical Dumbbell Rack	1	Fitness First 10 Pair Dumbbell Rack	Frame: 10 Years Parts: 1 Year	\$ 122.00	\$ 122.00	French Fitness Free Standing Vertical Dumbbell Rack 5-50lbs, 10 Pairs	10 Years Parts, 1 Year Labor	\$ 451.44	\$ 451.44
26	PowerStream 5lbs-100lbs Urethane Pro Style Dumbbells	1	Fitness First Urethane Pro Style Dumbbells 5lb to 100 lb	Five Years	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	French Fitness Urethane Round Pro Style Dumbbell Set, 5-100lbs	1 Year Limited	\$ 5,718.24	\$ 5,718.24
27	TKO 3'x6' gym Folding Exercise Mat	1	Bid as Requested	1 Year	\$ 82.00	\$ 82.00	French Fitness Tri-Fold Folding Exercise Mat	1 Year Limited	\$ 47.52	\$ 47.52
28	TRX Straps	2	Bid as Requested	2 Years	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.90	French Fitness Suspension Trainer STP3 w/Rubber Handle	1 Year Limited	\$ 95.92	\$ 191.84
29	DXP Black Trap Bar	1	Body Solid OTB50RH Olympic Trap Bar Raised Handles-Chrome	5 Years	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	French Fitness 85" XL Trap Bar w/ 16" Loadable Sleezes - Black	1 Year Limited	\$ 241.12	\$ 241.12
30	Functional Accessory Kit including rope, D Handles, 40" bar and ankle straps	1	Included with Item #1	Upholstery/grips/rollers: 6 months	\$ -	\$ -	French Fitness Rubber Grip RGH45 Revolving Stirrup Handle & French Fitness FF-ACS Ankle Cuff/Strap	1 Year Limited	\$21.12 Rubber Stirrup Handle \$12.32 Ankle Cuff	\$21.12 Rubber Stirrup Handle \$12.32 Ankle Cuff
				Equipment Total		\$ 23,768.09				\$ 32,747.35
				Installation		\$ 5,840.00				
				Shipping		\$ 7,500.00				
				Total Bid		\$ 37,108.09				

EP24/25-012 Police Department Fitness Equipment
 Bid Opening: Thursday, May 1, 2025 at 11:00am

Bid Alternate Items/Manufacturers

Item Number	Description	Quantity	Fittrax Fitness Systems				WynnPro/PMX Promaxima			
			Substitution/Alternative Mfg.	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price	Substitution/Alternative Mfg.	Warranty	Price per Unit	Total Price
1	BATCA Axis Free Trainer/functional Trainer 200Lbs. Weight Stacks	1	Bid as Requested	-	\$ 3,495.00	\$ 3,495.00	Dual Adjustable Pulley System	-	\$ 3,055.31	\$ 3,055.31
2	BATCA Axis Free-Weight Rack	1	Bid as Requested	-	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	PMX Series Half Rack 3x3 11g Uprights		\$ 1,864.30	\$ 1,864.30
3	BATCA Axis Smith Trainer with Storage	1	Bid as Requested	-	\$ 3,295.00	\$ 3,295.00	Heavy Duty Smith Machine	-	\$ 2,038.27	\$ 2,038.27
4	Spirit Fitness Adjustable Ab Bench, Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	1	Spirit Adjustable Ab Bench	-	\$ 995.00	\$ 995.00	Adjustable Decline Bench	-	\$ 413.54	\$ 413.54
5	Spirit Fitness Adjustable Bench Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Deluxe Adjustable Bench with Wheels		\$ 594.82	\$ 1,784.48
6	Spirit CT800 Treadmill Standard Console: US Commercial	1	Spirit CT800 Treadmill	10 Years Frame, 5 years motor, deck, and parts, and 6 months wear items	\$ 3,295.00	\$ 3,295.00	GT5 Galaxy Serie Treadmill	-	\$ 2,775.85	\$ 2,775.85
7	Spirit AB950 Airbike: US Commercial	1	Spirit AirBike	5 Years Frame, 2 years console and mechanical parts, and 1 year labor	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,700.00	Air Raid Airbike		\$ 1,024.85	\$ 1,024.85
8	Spirit Fitness Vertical Leg Raise/Dip Cranberry Red Upholstery with Custom Embroidered Police Department Patch	1	Spirit Vertical Knee Raise	10 years frame, welds, cams, plates; 5 years bushing, bearings, shocks, pulleys, guide rods; 6 months upholstery; 1 year paint & finishes, cables, grips, pull-pin components, rail wheels, attachments, all other parts, labor	\$ 999.00	\$ 999.00	Leg Raise/Dip and Push Up Station		\$ 520.05	\$ 520.05
9	Nautilus Triple Dumbbell Rack	1	Spirit 3 Tier Dumbbell Rack	10 Years frame; 6 months protective tray/bar sleeves	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	Raptor 3 Tiered Saddle Dumbbell Rack 11'		\$ 736.45	\$ 736.45
10	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 45lbs	10	Bodysolid Bumper Plate 45 lbs.	-	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,250.00	45 lb Solid Rubber Bumper Plate	-	\$ 72.10	\$ 721.00
11	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 35lbs	6	Bodysolid Bumper Plate 35 lbs.	-	\$ 99.00	\$ 594.00	35 lb Solid Rubber Bumper Plate	-	\$ 56.65	\$ 339.90
12	Power Stream Olympic Bumper Plate 25lbs	6	Bodysolid Bumper Plate 25 lbs.	-	\$ 80.00	\$ 480.00	25 lb Solid Rubber Bumper Plate	-	\$ 46.35	\$ 278.10
13	Power Stream Olympic Urethane Plate 10lbs	12	Bodysolid Bumper Plate 10 lbs	-	\$ 29.00	\$ 348.00	10 lb Urethane Olympic Grip	-	\$ 28.32	\$ 339.90
14	Power Stream Olympic Urethane Plate 5lbs	10	Bodysolid Rubber Oly Plate 5 lbs	-	\$ 12.00	\$ 120.00	5 lb Urethane Olympic Grip	-	\$ 18.02	\$ 180.25
15	DXP Kettle Bell Rack	1	Bodysolid Kettlebell Rack	-	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	3 Tier Kettlebell Rack 48" Long	-	\$ 406.75	\$ 406.75
16	Kettle Bell Set 5-50lbs	1	Bodysolid Kettlebell Set 5-50 lbs.	-	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	Cast Iron Kettlebell Set	-	\$ 566.50	\$ 566.50

FITNESSMITH



RFP EP24/25-012
Police Department Fitness Room Equipment

Equipment Warranty

Batca Fitness:

Batca Fitness Systems warrants all of its products against defects in manufacturing, materials and workmanship under normal use and service for six months from date of purchase including paint, chrome, upholstery and grips. Batca Fitness Systems also warrants all cables, belts, bolts, nuts, caps, plugs, bumpers, washers, levelers, decals, gas springs and other hardware for one year after date of purchase; all moving parts, including pulleys, bushings, bearings and pull pins for three years after date of purchase and warrants the frame and all welded parts for ten years after date of purchase.

Spirit Fitness:

Strength - 10 years frame/welds/cams/plates; 5 years bushing/bearings/shocks/pulleys/guide rods; 6 months upholstery; 1 year paint & Finishes/cables/grips/pull-pin components/rail wheels/attachments/all other parts/labor

Treadmill - 10 years frame, 5 years motor, deck and parts, 2 years labor, and 6 months wear items

AirBike - 5 years frame, 2 years console and mechanical parts, and 1 year labor

Troy Fitness:

Racks - Limited Lifetime warranty against breakage and 1-year warranty against manufacture defects.

Bumper Plates - 2-year warranty

Kettlebells - 1-year warranty

Bars - 5-year warranty

Dumbbells - 5-year warranty

Power Systems:

Bars - 90-day warranty

Racks - 90-day warranty

Mats - 90 day warranty

TKO Racks: 10-year frame, 1-year parts

TRX Suspension Trainers: 2-year warranty