ROBERTO L. DASILVA
MAYOR

JESSICA LAMPREY
PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST

CITY OF EAST PROVIDENCE
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
145 TAUNTON AVENUE
EAST PROVIDENCE, RI 02914

Bid Tabulations Monday, June 30, 2025

RFP EP24/25-013  Purchase of Trees for Various City Projects
RFP EP24/25-014  Tree Planting Services — Rotating List
Location: Conference Room A, East Providence City Hall

Present: Jessica Lamprey, Procurement Specialist
Molly Ahern, Senior Planner

Representatives: None

All bids have been properly advertised. An Anti-Collusion Statement must be included in each bid
submission or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All
bid submissions will go to the appropriate departments for their review and recommendation.

Continued next page




RFP EP24/25-013 Purchase of Trees for Various City Projects

e 3 Bids Received

Continued next page

Schichtel’s Nursery, Inc.
7420 Peters Road
Springville, NY 14141

Central Nurseries, Inc.
1155 Atwood Ave
Johnston, R1 02919

SiteOne Landscape Supply
1385 East 36™ Street
Cleveland, OH 44114

Pricing as Follows




RFP EP24/25-013 Purchase of Trees for Various City Projects

Bid Tabulations

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc.

Central Nurseries

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Scientific Name

Common Name

DBH (inches)

Price (each)

Quantity
Available

Price (Each)

Quantity
Available

Price (Each)

Quantity Available

Acer x freemani

‘Armstrong’ Red
Maple

1.5-2

$136.00

200+

$220.00 15

$225.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$185.00

200+

$260.00 i5

$285.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$240.00

200+

$355.00 10

$375.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$475.00 10

$475.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Acer rubrum

Red Maple

$128.00

200+

$220.00 25

$200.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$150.00

200+

$260.00 25

$240.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

$175.00

100+

$355.00 20

$325.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$210.00

50+

$475.00 15

$460.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Amelanchier spp.

Serviceberry

1.5-2

$160.00

100+

$245.00 10

$275.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$210.00

25+

$285.00 10

$375.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

No Bid

No Bid

$375.00

$425.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$495.00

$650.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Betula nigra

River Birch

$136.00

200+

$220.00 20

$165.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$185.00

50+

$255.00 15

$346.23

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$240.00

50+

$310.00 20

$453.41

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$250.00

50+

$365.00 10

$479.63

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Carpinus
caroliniana

American
hornbeam
(musclewood)

1.5-2

$160.00

100+

$230.00 10

$275.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$210.00

50+

$285.00 10

$375.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

No Bid

No Bid

$375.00

$430.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$495.00

$680.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Continued next page




RFP EP24/25-013 Purchase of Trees for Various City Projects

Bid Tabulations

Schichtel's Nursery, Inec.

Central Nurseries

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Scientific Name

Common Name

DBH (inches)

Price (each)

Quantity
Available

Price (Each)

Quantity
Available

Price (Each)

Quantity Available

Crataegus spp.

Hawthorn

1.5-2

$128.00

100+

$225.00 15

$250.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$150.00

50+

$265.00 15

$325.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

No Bid

No Bid

$375.00 10

$395.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$460.00 10

$485.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Celltis occidentalis

American
Hackberry

$136.00

100+

$225.00 15

$250.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

225

$185.00

100+

$260.00 10

$325.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$240.00

100+

$355.00

$395.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$270.00

100+

$485.00

$550.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Ilex opaca

Anmerican holly

No Bid

No Bid

$225.00

$425.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

No Bid

No Bid

$255.00

$425.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

No Bid

No Bid

$360.00

$625.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$475.00

$750.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Juniperus
virginiana

Eastern red cedar

1.5-2

$128.00

200+

$180.00 15

$250.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$150.00

100+

$200.00 15

$299.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

$185.00

25+

$235.00

$399.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$310.00

$485.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Malus spp.

Crabapple

1.5-2

$128.00

200+

$220.00

$225.00

SUBJECT to

ovailahilitie ot tima

$150.00

100+

$255.00 20

$499.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$175.00

50+

$335.00 10

$599.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$210.00

50+

$435.00

$699.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Continued next page




RFP EP24/25-013 Purchase of Trees for Various City Projects

Bid Tabulations

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc,

Central Nurseries

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Scientific Name

Common Name

DBH (inches)

Price (each)

Quantity
Available

Price (Each)

Quantity
Available

Price (Each)

Quantity Available

Nyssa sylvatica

Black tupelo

1.5-2

$168.00

200+

$240.00 10

$259.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$226.00

100+

$295.00 20

$329.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

No Bid

No Bid

$370.00 10

$449.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$495.00

$629.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Quercus alba

White oak

1.5-2

$168.00

200+

$225.00 20

$250.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$226.00

200+

$265.00 20

$349.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

No Bid

No Bid

$360.00 10

$395.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$485.00 10

$499.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Quercus bicolor

Swamp white oak

1.5-2

$136.00

200+

$225.00 20

$239.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$185.00

25+

$265.00 20

$315.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

No Bid

No Bid

$360.00 20

$355.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$485.00

$499.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Quercus palustris

Pin oak

$136.00

200+

$225.00 20

$259.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-25

$185.00

100+

$260.00 15

$297.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$240.00

100+

$350.00 15

$345.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$270.00

50+

$470.00 10

$475.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Quercus phellos

Willow oak

No Bid

No Bid

$225.00

$225.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

No Bid

No Bid

$265.00

$295.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

No Bid

No Bid

$360.00

$359.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

No Bid

No Bid

$485.00

$529.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Continued next page




RFP EP24/25-013 Purchase of Trees for Various City Projects
Bid Tabulations

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc.

Central Nurseries

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Scientific Name

Common Name

DBH (inches)

Price (each)

Quantity
Available

Quantity

Price (Bach) | L ilable

Price (Each)

Quantity Available

Quercus rubra

Red oak

1.5-2

$136.00

200+

$225.00 20

$225.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

225

$196.00

200+

$265.00 15

$325.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

$240.00

50+

$360.00 25

$395.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$270.00

50+

$485.00 20

$495.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Platanus spp.

Sycamores (any
native species or
cultivar)

1.5-2

$136.00

200+

$225.00 20

$225.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$164.00

200+

$260.00 20

$295.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

$210.00

100+

$350.00 20

$375.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$270.00

50+

$435.00 20

$450.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Pinus strobus

Eastern white pine

1.5-2

$131.00

100+

$175.00 20

$195.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$156.00

50+

$210.00 20

$269.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

$196.00

25+

$260.00 20

$315.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$240.00

25+

$365.00 10

$399.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Tilia americana

Anmerican linden

1.5-2

$136.00

200+

$225.00 20

$225.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2-2.5

$185.00

100+

$265.00 15

$305.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

$240.00

100+

$360.00

$395.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$270.00

50+

$475.00

$550.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Ulmus americana

American elm

$136.00

200+

$225.00 20

$225.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

225

$185.00

200+

$265.00 20

$279.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

2.5-3

$240.00

50+

$350.00 20

$329.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

3+

$270.00

50+

$465.00 15

$429.00

Subject to
availability at time
of order

Notes: Current/projected
availability is listed, subject to
change.

Delivery is in addition to the




REP EP24/25-014 Tree Planting Services — Rotating List

¢ 3 Bids Received

Johnson Landscaping, Inc.
279 Beverage Hill Ave.
Pawtucket, RI 02860

North-Eastern Tree Service, Inc.
1000 Pontiac Ave.
Cranston, RI 02920

Central Nurseries, Inc.
1155 Atwood Ave.
Johnston, RI 02919

Johnson Landscaping, North-E:astern Tree Central Nurseries, Inc.
Inc. Service, Inc.
Service Unit Price ($) Unit Price (§) Unit Price (%)
Sawcut pavement for
tree pits (per linear foot $3.50 $10.00 $40.00
of sidewalk cut)
Prepare planting holes $9.50 $14.00 $42.00
(per square foot)
Install balled and
burlapped trees between $418.50 $880.00 $600.00
2-2.5” caliper (each)
Re;tore abandoned tree $17.50 $40.00 $42.00
pits (per square foot)




