
CITY OF EAST PROVIDENCE

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

RFP EP23/24-11 SAND, GRIT, GRAVEL, LOAM, AND STONE

BID TABULATIONS

Item # Description Quantity (Tons)
Price Per Ton 

(Pickup)

Price Per Ton 

(Delivered)

Price Per Ton 

(Pickup)

Price Per Ton 

(Delivered)

Price Per Ton 

(Pickup)

Price Per Ton 

(Delivered)

1 Screened Sand 5000 $18.95 $29.45 $32.22 $40.74 $30.00 No Bid

2 Subbase Gravel 300 $18.95 $29.45 $17.00 $27.59 $13.00 No Bid

3 Base Course Gravel 3000 $18.50 $29.00 $17.00 $27.59 $13.00 No Bid

4 Crushed Stone 500 $19.95 $28.45 $17.00 $27.59 $25.00 No Bid

5
1.5 in. - 3/4 in. Washed 

Angular Crushed Stone
1500 $18.95 $27.45 $15.84 $26.43 $45.00 No Bid

6 3/8" Peastone 250 $19.95 $28.45 $28.11 $39.04 $30.00 No Bid

7 Fill Material 250 $7.50 $18.00 $11.67 $22.26 $10.50 No Bid

8 Unscreened Loam 250 No Bid No Bid $12.00 $20.52 $17.00 No Bid

9 Screened Loam 4750 $23.50 $32.00 $17.76 $26.28 $45.00 No Bid

10 Blue Stone Dust 250 $23.50 $36.00 $27.41 $35.93 $25.00 No Bid

11 Mason Sand (Brick Sand) 250 $21.95 $34.95 $32.22 $40.42 $45.00 No Bid

12 Rip Rap 200 Yards $23.45 $36.95 $19.79 $28.31 $25.00 No Bid

13
Permeable Pavement 

Materials 
As Needed

a. Choker Coarse As Needed $25.50 $39.30 $20.00 $30.93 $45.00 No Bid

b. Filter Coarse As Needed $19.95 $33.75 $20.00 $30.93 $45.00 No Bid

c. Reservoir Coarse As Needed $24.95 $38.75 $20.00 $30.93 $45.00 No Bid

G. Lopes JR. Vinagro Lynch Corp. 


