CITY OF EAST PROVIDENCE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

RFP23/24-10 PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
BID TABULATIONS

D'Ambra Johnston Asphalt, Narragansett

ITEM# DESCRIPTION Construction LLC Improvement Co. Lynch Corp.

I Hot Plant Winter Bituminous No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00/Ton
Material

y, | Modified Ci';tf!?,ﬁf Bituminous $80.00/Ton $90.00/Ton $94.00/Ton $100.00/Ton
[l. Modified Cold Plant Mix $185.00/Ton $138.00/Ton No Bid No Bid
V. Return Credit $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
V. Return Charge $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00




