
  

 ROBERTO L. DASILVA       JESSICA LAMPREY 

             MAYOR             PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST 

 

 

 

CITY OF EAST PROVIDENCE 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE 

145 TAUNTON AVENUE 

EAST PROVIDENCE, RI 02914 

 

Bid Tabulations Thursday, June 12, 2025 

 

  

RFP EP24/25-015 Police Duty Firearms 

 

RFP EP24/25-016 Police Duty Holsters & Weapon Mounted Flashlights 

 

 Location:  Conference Room A, East Providence City Hall 

 

 Present:  Jessica Lamprey, Procurement Specialist 

 

 Representatives:  None 

 

 

All bids have been properly advertised. An Anti-Collusion Statement must be included in each bid 

submission or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All 

bid submissions will go to the appropriate departments for their review and recommendation.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 Jessica Lamprey 
 Jessica Lamprey 

 Procurement Specialist 

 

 

 

 

Continued next page 



EP24/25-015 Police Duty Firearms 

• 2 Bids Received 

 

 

AmChar Wholesale, Inc.  

100 Airpark Drive 

Rochester, NY 14624 

 

Witmer Public Safety Group, Inc.  

104 Independence Way 

Coatesville, PA 19320 

 

 

   AmChar Wholesale, Inc. 
Witmer Public Safety Group, 

Inc 

Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total 

1 

Glock Model 45 MOS 

w/ Holoson 509T 

Optic – case w/ 3 

mags 

75 $          828.91 $          62,168.25 $          828.91 $          62,168.25 

2 

Glock Model 43X 

MOS w/ Aimpoint 

COA Optic – case w/ 

3 mags 

8 $          619.60 $            4,956.80 $          614.60 $            4,916.80 

3 

TRADE-IN Glock 

Model 17 w/ case & 3 

mags 

60 
$          310.00 $          18,600.00 $          260.00 $          15,600.00 

(Credit) (Credit) (Credit) (Credit) 

4 

TRADE-IN Glock 

Model 43X w/ case & 

3 mags 

4 
$          250.00 $            1,000.00 $          250.00 $            1,000.00 

(Credit) (Credit) (Credit) (Credit) 
 Total Bid Price   $        47,525.05  $        50,485.05 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



EP24/25-016 Police Duty Holsters & Weapon Mounted Flashlights 

• 5 Bids Received 

 

AAA Police Supply 

940 Providence Street 

Dedham, MA 02026 

 

Atlantic Tactical, Inc.  

772 Corporate Circle 

New Cumberland, PA 17070 

 

Witmer Public Safety Group, Inc.  

104 Independence Way 

Coatesville, PA 19320 

 

AmChar Wholesale, Inc.  

100 Airpark Drive 

Rochester, NY 14624 

 

GT Distributors, Inc.  

1124 New Meister Lane, Suite 100 

Pflugerville, TX 78660 

 

 

 

Pricing as Follows 
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EP24/25-016 Police Duty Holsters & Weapon Mounted Flashlights 

 

   AAA Police Supply Atlantic Tactical, Inc. 
Witmer Public Safety 

Group, Inc. 

AmChar Wholesale, 

Inc. 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

Item Description Qty 
Unit 

Price 
Total 

Unit 

Price 
Total 

Unit 

Price 
Total 

Unit 

Price 
Total 

Unit 

Price 
Total 

1 Streamlight TLR-7X 75 $129.99 $9,749.25 $114.21 $8,565.75 $135.00 $10,125.00 $135.75 $10,181.25 $135.75 $10,181.25 

2 

Safariland 7360RDS-

28327 – Level III 

Retention Duty 

Holster (Plain Finish) 

RIGHT-HANDED 

65 $143.27 $9,312.55 $163.32 $10,615.80 $165.00 $10,725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 

Safariland 7360RDS-

28327 – Level III 

Retention Duty 

Holster (Plain Finish) 

LEFT-HANDED 

10 $143.27 $1,432.70 $163.32 $1,633.20 $165.00 $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 

Safariland Solis ALS 

Concealment OWB 

Holster (Part SOLIS-

1-2835-A-7-C1-412) 

paddle only RIGHT-

HANDED 

15 $49.99 $749.85 $58.69 $880.35 $67.00 $1,005.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 

Safariland Solis ALS 

Concealment OWB 

Holster (Part SOLIS-

1-2835-A-7-C1-412) 

paddle only LEFT-

HANDED 

5 $49.99 $249.95 $58.69 $293.45 $67.00 $335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 
Streamlight TLR-

7/X/HL-XSub 
8 $149.99 $1,199.92 $132.83 $1,062.64 $158.00 $1,264.00 $135.75 $1,086.00 $157.86 $1,262.88 

7 

Safariland Solis ALS 

Concealment OWB 

Holster (Part SOLIS-

1-895-2-7-C1-411) 

paddle only RIGHT-

HANDED 

7 $49.99 $349.93 $60.28 $421.96 $67.00 $469.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Total Bid Price 

(Items 1-7) 
  $23,044.15  $23,473.15  $25,573.00  $11,267.25  $11,444.13 

 


