CITY OF EAST PROVIDENCE

POLICE DEPARTMENT - HABORMASTER

RFP EP23/24-05

POLICE PATROL BOAT SLIPS, WINTERIZATION, AND REPAIRS

BID OPENING THURSDAY, JANUARY 18, 2024 11:00AM

Safe Harbor Cove Haven
101 Narragansett Ave.
Barrington, RI1 02806

Lighthouse Marina, LLC
110 Shore Dr.
Barrington, RI1 02806

Item Qty. Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 1 30 Foot Boat Slip- 6 month Seasonal Charge $ 497450 | $ 497450 | $ 4,320.00 | $ 4,320.00

2 2 24 Foot Boat Slip - 6 Month Seasonal Charge $ 3,965.50 | $ 7,931.00 | $ 3,312.00 | $ 6,624.00

3 3 Winter Storage for Boats on Trailers - 6 Months $6.10/sq. foot $6.10/sq. foot $ 2,840.00 | $ 2,840.00

4 3 Summer Storage for Empty Trailers - 6 Months $675.00 $ 2,025.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 900.00

5 2 Winterization - 300 HP Mercury Verado Outboard Motor $136.50/hour'for time & $136.50/hour.for time & No Bid No Bid
materials materials

6 2 Winterization - 225 HP Mercury Verado Outboard Motor $136.50/hour_for time & $136.50/h0ur_for time & No Bid No Bid
materials materials

7 1 Shrink Wrap - 27' Boston Whaler Vigilant $3.75/sq. foot $ 810.00 No Bid No Bid

8 1 Shrink Wrap - 23" North Coast Center Console $3.75/sq. foot $ 690.00 No Bid No Bid

9 1 Shrink Wrap - 21' Boston Whaler Impact Center Console $3.75/sq. foot $ 610.00 No Bid No Bid

10 - Hourly Labor Rate for Service and/or Repairs $136.50/hour.for time & $136.50/hour.for time & No Bid No Bid
materials materials




